Mackil, Molly J. (DNREC)

From: Krumrine Beth L. (DNREC)

Sent: Thursday, July 21, 2011 12:01 PM

To: Defriece John R. (DNREC); Underwood Robert (DNREC); Davis Glenn F. (DNREC)
Cc: Wirick Katherine R. (DNREC); Mann Stephen M. (DNREC)

Subject: RE: Allen Family Foods - Bankruptcy Notice

No. We don’t have any other Allen’s in our database. Thanks for letting us know though!

From: Defriece John R. (DNREC)

Sent: Thursday, July 21, 2011 11:33 AM

To: Underwood Robert (DNREC); Davis Glenn F. (DNREC)

Cc: Wirick Katherine R. (DNREC); Krumrine Beth L. (DNREC); Mann Stephen M. (DNREC)
Subject: RE: Allen Family Foods - Bankruptcy Notice

Rob,

Only one Allen’s FF site in De. has an individual NPDES permit, the one in Harbeson (DE0000299), No. 1 in the
picture below.

Cc’'ing Beth & Steve to see if any other sites are in DE. & have SW GP coverage.

Radio last few weeks mentioned maybe 11 AFF sites in Delmarva. A new division of Mountaire is supposed to
buy some of them.

John
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John R. DeFriece, P.E.

Program Manager |

Discharge Permits Program
Surface Water Discharges Section
Division of Water Resources
DNREC

89 Kings Hwy.

Dover, De. 19901

Phone: (302)739-9946
Fax: (302)-739-8369

From: Underwood Robert (DNREC)

Sent: Thursday, July 21, 2011 10:58 AM

To: Davis Glenn F. (DNREC); Defriece John R. (DNREC)
Cc: Wirick Katherine R. (DNREC)

Subject: FW: Allen Family Foods - Bankruptcy Notice

FYI

From: Schneider John W. (DNREC)
Sent: Thursday, July 21, 2011 10:28 AM
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To: Underwood Robert (DNREC)
Subject: FW: Allen Family Foods - Bankruptcy Notice

Rob—Do they have an NPDES permit? John

From: Parker Tracey W. (DNREC)

Sent: Thursday, July 21, 2011 6:40 AM

To: Baldwin Robert S. (DNREC); Barthelmeh Thomas G. (DNREC); Brower Daniel J. (DNREC); Cahall Brooks P. (DNREC);
Enright Robert (DNREC); Gmuer Chery! L. (DNREC); Grabowski Matthew T. (DNREC); Jones Lyle A. (DNREC); Leahy Brian
M. (DNREC); Palmer Robert R. (DNREC); Piorko Frank M. (DNREC); Powell Michael S. (DNREC); Pratt Tony P. (DNREC);
Rutherford Jamie H. (DNREC); Schneider John W. (DNREC); Smith Bradford L. (DNREC); Williams Charles E. (DNREC);
Williams Stephen N. (DNREC)

Subject: FW: Allen Family Foods - Bankruptcy Notice

Please see Jenny’s email below re: Allen Family Foods and respond accordingly.

Thanks.
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Sracey, . Parker

DNREC, Financial Services

(802) 739-9145, 739-9940 or 739-9921

Fax (802) 789-6724

From: Zink Rebecca A. (DNREC)

Sent: Wednesday, July 20, 2011 5:22 PM

To: Baxter Carol (DNREC); Cassell-Carter Carla M. (DNREC); Parker Tracey W. (DNREC); Leahy Brian M. (DNREC);
Michalek Susan M. (DNREC)

Cc: Bachavala Ashwini S. (DNREC); Hurley Wanda S. (DNREC); Bothell Jennifer M. (DNREC)

Subject: FW: Allen Family Foods - Bankruptcy Notice

FYI~ please be advised of the Bankruptcy Notice below. Let Jenny know if you have anything outstanding to Jenny
within the 10 day period.

Thanks
Becca

Rebecca A. Zink

Fiscal Administrative Officer
Financial Services, DNREC
Phone: 302.739.9903

Fax: 302.739.7014

From: Bothell Jennifer M. (DNREC)

Sent: Wednesday, July 20, 2011 1:24 PM

To: Zink Rebecca A. (DNREC); Vennard Christine (DNREC)
Subject: Allen Family Foods - Bankruptcy Notice



Hi Becca and Chris...We've received a notice of Bankruptcy for Allen Family Foods (attached, pdf), which is filing for a
reorganization plan under Chapter 11. As this is a facility that may have multiple programs affected, | am forwarding this
notice to you both for distribution to all Divisions/Programs fiscal offices so that we get a full picture of what permit
fees, loans, grants, etc., may be owed to DNREC.

Please have those sections send a reply to me in 10 days if there are any outstanding fees/grants/loans, etc. owed, and |
can coordinate the listing to send to Legal so that we have a DAG assigned to file a proof of claim if needed. There is not
a date set yet for filing proof of claims, but wanted to get an idea how many claims there might be throughout the
Department and get a legal request completed sooner than later, so we have an attorney assigned.

Off the top of my head, | am aware of Allen’s having an Air permit and probably a NPDES permit as well. Thanks! Jenny.

Jennifer M. Bothell

Enforcement Coordinator

Office of the Secretary

Delaware Department of Natural Resources
and Environmental Control

89 Kings Highway

Dover, DE 19901

Phone: (302) 739-9037 or (302) 739-9000

Fax: (302) 739-6242

jennifer.bothell@state.de.us




