Mackil, Mollx J. (DNREC)

From: Small, David (DNREC)

Sent: Thursday, February 21, 2013 8:34 AM

To: Stiller, Kathleen M. (DNREC); Davis, Glenn F. (DNREC); Ashby, Bryan A. (DNREC);
Schneider, John W. (DNREC)

Subject: Allen Harim Foods - Millsboro, DE

Attachments: Quathamer 02.19.13 - DRAFT.pdf; ATT00001.htm; CE 02.19.13-FEB Only.pdf;

ATT00002.htm

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Flagged

Please review and we will probably need to sit down again to discuss...thanks

From: Brian Hildreth [mailto:brian.hildreth@allenharimilc.com]
Sent: Wednesday, February 20, 2013 3:53 PM

To: Small, David (DNREC); Kee, Edwin (DDA)

Subject: FW: Allen Harim Foods - Millsboro, DE

Attached is information discussed this morning. Thank you again for your help.
Brian

Brian G. Hildreth

Chief Financial Officer

Allen Harim Foods, LLC
Allen Harim Farms, LLC
Allen Biotech, LLC
126 North Shipley St.
Seaford, DE 19973
(302) 629-9180 ext 180

IMPORTANT: This e-mail and any attachments may contain confidential, proprietary, and/or privileged
information.

If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately by return e-mail, delete this e-
mail,

and destroy any copies. Any dissemination, copying, retention, printing, or use of this information by a person
other than the intended recipient is unauthorized and may be illegal. Any opinions expressed in this e-mail are
those of the author and may not reflect the views of the company.

From: Jim Quinton

Sent: Wednesday, February 20, 2013 7:52 AM
To: Brian Hildreth; Gary Gladys

Subject: Fwd: Allen Harim Foods - Millsboro, DE

Attached is the draft copy for waste water for your review

Sent from my iPhone



Begin forwarded message:

From: "Henry Quathamer"” <henry.quathamer(@allenharimllc.com>
To: "Jim Quinton" <jim.quinton@allenharimllc.com>
Subject: FW: Allen Harim Foods - Millsboro, DE

FYI

From: John Reid [mailto:jreid@reidengineering.com]
Sent: Tuesday, February 19,2013 11:12 AM

To: Henry Quathamer

Subject: Allen Harim Foods - Millsboro, DE

Henry,

Please see attached letter summarizing the proposed wastewater treatment system with attached
preliminary layout drawing and preliminary cost estimate. I have also included a preliminary
cost estimate for an FEB for the DAF pretreatment system.

Best regards,

John H. Reid, PE

President

Reid Engineering Company
1210 Princess Anne Street
Fredericksburg, VA 22401
(540) 371-8500



